
 
 
     
 
 

 

 
 

October 1, 2009 (Revised January, 2010)

 
CITY OF PALM COAST TECHNICAL MANUAL 

 
 
 

 
SECTION V 
 

                 

     
    
 
 
 
 

    
  
    
  DDeessiiggnn  SSttaannddaarrddss  
  
 

Effective November 16, 2008 
 
 
 
 

 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

ENGINEERING 







 
 
     

 

   

CITY OF PALM COAST TECHNICAL MANUAL 
ENGINEERING DESIGN STANDARDS  

Table of Contents V-iii  
October 1, 2009 (Revised January, 2010) 

 

TABLE OF CONTENTS 
 

SECTION 1100 PRESERVATION AND PROTECTION OF SHORES AND CHANNELS    89 
Section 1100.01  Control of Shores and Channels       89 
Section 1100.02  Reservation of Rights        89 
Section 1100.03  Use of Waterways         89 
Section 1100.04  Piers and Related Structures       90 
Section 1100.05  Mooring and Storage of Watercraft      90 
Section 1100.06  Saltwater Canals         91 

Drawing # 1100.A  Saltwater Canal Typical Seawall      91 
Drawing # 1100.B  Saltwater Canal Typical Bulkhead     92 
Drawing # 1100.C  Saltwater Canal Typical Revetment (Rip Rap)    92 
Drawing # 1100.D  Saltwater Canal Typical Undisturbed Bank    93 

Section 1100.07  Tidal Datum for Palm Coast       93 
Section 1100.08  Dredging          94 
Section 1100.09  Seawalls / Bulkheads and Revetments      94 

Drawing # 1100.E  Saltwater Canal Typical Seawall Profiles    94 
Drawing # 1100.F  Saltwater Canal Typical Bulkhead Profile    94 
Drawing # 1100.G  Saltwater Canal Typical Seawall/ Bulkhead End Return Detail  95 

   Drawing # 1100.H  Typical Saltwater Canal Revetment (Rip Rap) Profile   96 
   Drawing # 1100.I  Typical Intracoastal Waterway Revetment (Rip Rap) Profile  96 
  Section 1100.10  Seawall / Bulkhead / Revetment Construction Permit Requirements  97 
   Drawing # 1100.J  Saltwater Canal Typical Seawall Grading Plan    97 
  Section 1100.11  Seawall / Bulkhead / Revetment Construction Permit Conditions  97 
   Drawing # 1100.K  Topographic Survey with Sample Barrier Plan    98 
  Section 1100.12  Docks on Saltwater Canals       99 
   Drawing # 1100.L  Saltwater Canal Typical Corner Dock Allocation    100 
   Drawing # 1100.M  Saltwater Canal Seawall Dock      101 
   Drawing # 1100.N  Saltwater Canal Bulkhead Dock      101 
   Table  # 1100.A  Saltwater Canal Roof Structure Diagram       101 
  Section 1100.12.1  Floating Docks on Saltwater Canals      102 
  Section 1100.12.2  Dock Lifts on Saltwater Canals       102 
  Section 1100.12.3  Cantilevered Safety Walks on Saltwater Canals    102 

 Section 1100.13  Docks on Intracoastal Waterway       102 
  Section 1100.14  Freshwater Canals         103 
   Drawing # 1100.P  Docks on Freshwater Canals      103 
  
 SECTION 1200 EROSION CONTROL          105 

Section 1200.01  Silt Fences / Floating Turbidity Barriers      105 
   Drawing # 1200.A  Silt Fence Example       105 
   Drawing # 1200.B  Floating Turbidity Barrier Example     106 
 
 SECTION 1300  CAPITAL PROJECTS – CITY OF PALM COAST       107 

Section 1300.01  Construction Information Signs       107 
Drawing # 1300.A  Sample Construction Sign      107  

Section 1300.02  Monument Sign for City Facilities       107 
Drawing # 1300.B  Sample Monument Sign       107  

 
 



 
 
     

11 V-1 
October 1, 2009 (Revised January, 2010) 

   

CITY OF PALM COAST TECHNICAL MANUAL 
ENGINEERING DESIGN STANDARDS  

 
 

 
 
 
 

These guidelines identify and define the City of Palm Coast requirements and policies for designing and 
installing telecommunications infrastructure and substructure at all City of Palm Coast facilities. Use of, 
and compliance with these guidelines is mandatory for architects, engineers, and installation 
contractors working on City of Palm Coast projects.  
 
 
 
 
 
A. The City of Palm Coast Infrastructure Standards are based upon the code requirements and 

telecommunications industry standards contained in the following guidelines. These guidelines 
will not duplicate the information contained in those references, except where necessary to 
provide guidance, clarification or direction.  

 
B. In instances where several technical alternatives may be available to provide a design solution, 

these guidelines will identify the preferred solution to meet City of Palm Coast needs. However, 
each facility and project is unique. Design for new construction will differ from design for retrofit 
of existing facilities. These guidelines will differentiate certain design approaches and solutions 
to be applied to new construction versus existing facilities, and different types of City of Palm 
Coast facilities. However, designers and installers shall always use sound engineering judgment 
in order to comply with the requirements of the codes and standards identified in this section.  

 
 
 
 
 
A. Adherence to, and compliance with, the codes and standards referenced, and the City of Palm 

Coast unique requirements and design solutions identified in the manual, is mandatory. 
Requests to deviate from the industry standards and design solutions prescribed in these 
guidelines may be submitted, on a case-by-case basis, to the City Engineer for review and 
approval. No deviation from the requirements of the National Electrical Code will be allowed.  

 
B. Architects, Consultants, and Contractors shall always reference the most recent standards 

available. Most references listed below can be purchased directly from the individual standards 
organization, or from:  
 
 Global Engineering Documents  
 Inverness Way East Englewood, CO 80112-5776  
 Telephone: (800) 854-7179 (303) 397-7956  
 Fax: (303) 397-2740  
 http://www.global.ihs.com 

 
 
 

Section 100.01 Scope of Standard  

Section 100.02 Design Guidelines

Section 100.03 Reference Standards  

SECTION 100  COMMUNICATION CONDUIT FOR FIBER OPTICS 
 



 
 
     

22 V-2 
October 1, 2009 (Revised January, 2010) 

   

CITY OF PALM COAST TECHNICAL MANUAL 
ENGINEERING DESIGN STANDARDS  

 
 
 
A. NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE, NFPA 70  
 The National Fire Protection Association has acted as the sponsor of the National Electrical 

Code (NEC) since 1911. The original Code was developed in 1897 as a result of the united 
efforts of various insurance, electrical, architectural, and allied interests. The purpose of the 
NEC is the practical safeguarding of persons and property from hazards arising from the use of 
electricity. The NEC provides the minimum code requirements for electrical safety. In 
telecommunications distribution design, the NEC must be used in concert with the ANSI/EIA/TIA 
standards identified below, which are intended to insure the performance of the 
telecommunications infrastructure.  

 
B. ANSI/TIA/EIA STANDARDS  
 The Telecommunications Industry Association/Electronics Industry Association (TIA/EIA) 

engineering standards and publications are designed to serve the public interest through 
eliminating misunderstandings between manufacturers and purchasers. The standards facilitate 
interchangeability and improvement of products and assist the purchaser in selecting and 
obtaining the proper product for his or her particular need.  

 
 The TIA/EIA Standards are updated every five years. Due to the rapid changes in the 

telecommunications and electronics industries, TIA/EIA publishes periodic Telecommunications 
Systems Bulletins (TSB), which provides additional guidance on certain technical issues that 
must be addressed prior to the next scheduled revision of the standards. The information 
contained in TSBs is usually incorporated into the applicable standard during the next standards 
revision. Standards and publications are adopted by TIA/EIA in accordance with American 
National Standards Institute (ANSI) patent policy. The TIA web site is: http://www.tiaonline.org/  

 
C. FIBER OPTIC TEST STANDARDS, TIA/EIA-526 (SERIES)  
 The TIA/EIA-455 series, together with its addenda, provides uniform test procedures for testing 

the fiber optic components intended for, or forming a part of, optical communications and data 
transmission systems. This series contains standard test procedures for optical fibers, cables, 
transducers, and connecting and terminating devices.  

 
D. CABLING STANDARD, ANSI/TIA/EIA-568 (SERIES)  

The ANSI/TIA/EIA-568-A (series) is the Commercial Building Telecommunications Cabling 
Standard. This standard defines a generic telecommunications wiring system for commercial 
buildings that will support a multiproduct, multivendor environment. It also provides direction for 
the design of telecommunications products for commercial enterprise. 
 
The purpose of the standard is to enable planning and installation of building wiring with little 
knowledge of the telecommunications products that subsequently will be installed. Installation of 
wiring systems during building construction or renovation is significantly less expensive and less 
disruptive than after the building is occupied. TIA/EIA-568-A establishes performance and 
technical criteria for various wiring system configurations for interfacing and connecting their 
respective elements.  

 
E. GROUNDING AND BONDING, ANSI/TIA/EIA-607 (SERIES)  
 The ANSI/TIA/EIA-606 (series) is the Commercial Building Grounding and Bonding 

Requirements for Telecommunications. The National Electrical Code (NEC) provides grounding, 
bonding, and electrical protection requirements to ensure life safety.  Modern 
telecommunications systems require an effective grounding infrastructure to insure optimum 

Section 100.04 Codes, Standards, References, and Applicability  



 
 
     

33 V-3 
October 1, 2009 (Revised January, 2010) 

   

CITY OF PALM COAST TECHNICAL MANUAL 
ENGINEERING DESIGN STANDARDS  

 performance of the wide variety of electronic information transport systems that may be used 
throughout the life of a building. The grounding and bonding requirements of this standard are 
additional technical requirements for telecommunications that are beyond the scope of the NEC.  
These standards are intended to work in concert with the cabling topology specified in 
ANSI/TIA/EIA-568-A, and installed in the pathways and spaces designed in accordance with 
ANSI/TIA/EIA-569-A.  

 
F. CUSTOMER OWNED OUTSIDE PLANT (OSP), ANSI/TIA/EIA-758  
 The ANSI/TIA/EIA-758 provides industry standards for the design and construction of customer 

owned OSP infrastructure. Unless specified otherwise in the City of Palm Coast standard OSP 
designed and constructed at all City of Palm Coast facilities will be in compliance with 
ANSI/TIA/EIA-758.  

 
G. TRANSMISSION PERFORMANCE SPECIFICATIONS, TIA/EIA BULLETIN TSB67  
 TSB67 is the Transmission Performance Specification for Field Testing of Unshielded Twisted-

Pair (UTP) Cabling Systems. This bulletin specifies the electrical characteristics and 
performance requirements of field test instruments, test methods, and the minimum 
transmission requirements for UTP cabling.  All testing of horizontal distribution cabling at City 
of Palm Coast facilities will be performed with a TSB67 Level II test instrument.  

 
H. ADDITIONAL HORIZONTAL CABLING PRACTICES FOR OPEN OFFICES, TIA/EIA  

BULLETIN TSB75  
 This document specifies optional practices for open office environments, for any horizontal 

telecommunications cabling recognized in TIA/EIA-568.  It specifies optional cabling schemes 
and topologies for horizontal cabling routed through modular office furniture or movable 
partitions, which are frequently reconfigured 

  
I. LOCAL AREA NETWORK ETHERNET STANDARD, IEEE 802.3 (SERIES)  
 City of Palm Coast utilizes the Ethernet LAN protocol at all facilities.  All City of Palm Coast 

infrastructure must be designed to support the Institute of Electrical and Electronic Engineers 
(IEEE) Ethernet 802.3 standards, which define protocols and signaling technologies. All newly 
installed cabling must support 1000BaseX Gigabit Ethernet protocol based on the IEEE 802.3z 
standard.  

 
J. THE BICSI TELECOMMUNICATIONS DISTRIBUTION METHODS MANUAL  
 The Building Industry Consulting Service International, Inc. (BICSI) is a Telecommunications 

Association whose mission is to provide state-of-the-art telecommunications knowledge to the 
industry, resulting in good service to the end user. BICSI develops and publishes the 
Telecommunications Distribution Methods Manual (TDMM). The TDMM is not a code or 
standard. The TDMM is an extensive volume of information on the various aspects of 
telecommunications systems and telecommunications distribution. The TDMM provides 
discussions and examples of various engineering methods and design solutions that can be 
selected and employed in order to meet the requirements of the NEC and ANSI/TIA/EIA 
standards. Designers and installers are encouraged to use the TDMM as an engineering tool, 
within the constraints of the unique requirements of the City of Palm Coast Infrastructure 
Standards.  

 
 
 
 
 
FDOT:  Florida Department of Transportation. 

Section 100.05 Definitions 



 
 
     

44 V-4 
October 1, 2009 (Revised January, 2010) 

   

CITY OF PALM COAST TECHNICAL MANUAL 
ENGINEERING DESIGN STANDARDS  

 
Fiber Optic Cable:  A cable that contains individual glass fibers, designed for the transmission of digital 
information, using light pulses. 
 
All Dielectric Self Support (ADSS) Cable:  A cable designed and constructed with non-metallic 
components, that is designed for aerial applications and does not require a separate cable messenger. 
 
Loose Tube Cable: A cable designed and constructed with non-metallic components, that is 
designed for underground applications. These are "dry" cables using water swellable powders to 
protect against water penetration. 
 
OTDR:  Optical Time Domain Reflectometer. A device used for characterizing a fiber, wherein an 
optical pulse is transmitted through the fiber and the resulting backscatter and reflections are measured 
as a function of time. 
 
Single-mode Fiber: An optical fiber with a small core diameter, in which only a single mode of light is 
capable of propagation. 
 
Multi-mode Fiber:  An optical fiber whose core diameter is large compared with the optical wavelength 
and which, consequently, a large number of light modes are capable of propagation. 
 
Splicing:  A permanent junction between optical fiber splices. May be thermally fused or mechanically 
applied. 
 
Minimum Bend Radius:  The minimum radius a fiber may be bent before optical losses are induced. 
 
 
 
 
 
The referenced RFP document shall pertain to anything not explicitly stated in this document.  
Governing FDOT Indexes and regulations should be used as well as all applicable codes in force. 
 
Conduit Placement 
The conduit shall be placed at an offset from the roadway that meets the governing FDOT regulations 
and Indexes while still staying within the ROW.  If this can not be accomplished please raise issue to 
the City of Palm Coast project engineer or liaison. 
 
Depth (Minimum / Maximum): 
The conduit used as the primary carrier of the fiber optic cable should be buried no greater than 42” 
and no less than 36” beneath grade except where code requires otherwise or directed in writing by the 
Project Engineer on behalf of the City of Palm Coast. 
 
Grade away from Buildings/Structures: 
The conduit shall be placed in such a way to as to maintain a gradual grade down away from buildings 
and other major structures. 
 
Conduit type/ Inner Duct type 
Standard placement shall be of 3 1.25” ID HDPE conduits loosely coiled around each other, direct 
buried/trenched/bored as appropriate to the construction needs. (Black, Black/Green, Black/Orange).  

Section 100.06 Guidelines for Designing Underground Fiber Optic Cable Routes 



 
 
     

55 V-5 
October 1, 2009 (Revised January, 2010) 

   

CITY OF PALM COAST TECHNICAL MANUAL 
ENGINEERING DESIGN STANDARDS  

If specified an outer conduit shall be of the HDPE type, of suitable strength per the governing FDOT 
indexes for the location of work.  Conduit shall be 4” I.D. in size with 3 1.25” ID Inner duct shall be of 
the HDPE smooth wall type as well, colored three separate colors  
 
All conduits and inner ducts should be cleared and cleaned prior to capping. 
 
Conduit Turns & Transitions 
All conduit turns shall be made with 45 degree bends or sweeps.  At no time shall 90 degree bends be 
utilized in the outside plant arena, unless it is an already existing conduit, and approved by the City of 
Palm Coast. 
 
Exceptions may be made to this rule for work inside of buildings. 
 
Trace Wire 
A minimum #12 AWG trace wire should be placed along with all conduit put in place.  This trace wire 
should maintain continuity from end station to end station.  Where possible it is okay to use vaults/hand 
holds for joining the trace wire, while keeping these joints visible and out of the way of the fiber cable.  
Where not possible please use the small hand hole for joining the trace wire. 
 
Marker Poles 
Easily visible, marked, 6’ fiber optic marker poles should be placed above the conduit at all major 
transitions to said conduit (turns greater than 25 degrees etc).  Please get marking poles approved by 
the City of Palm Coast prior to installation/purchase. 
 
Conduit Entering Hand Holes/Man Holes 
All conduits should be stubbed up underneath the bottom of each manhole/hand hole leaving at least 8” 
but no more than 12” of visible conduit exposed.  Conduit and inner ducts should be capped until use, 
after use they should be plugged appropriately to maintain the integrity of the conduit/inner duct from 
dirt and water. 
 
Locate Information 
As an as-built information gathering job, all splice points, vaults/hand hole/manhole/conduit turns of 45 
degrees or greater should receive a GPS coordinate that is marked and labeled back onto the as-built 
drawings.  
 
Building Entrances 
All building entrances should be checked and approved with the City of Palm Coast Project Engineer or 
liaison.  Preference is given in the following order (but dictated by the facility itself) core drilling and 
bringing conduit up through the floor, utilizing existing conduit to enter the building, bringing conduit up 
the outside of a facility, attaching a pullbox to the exterior of said building and entering through the wall 
of the building. 
 
Box Sizing 
Please confirm with the City of Palm Coast your selection of boxes and box sizes PRIOR to utilization 
of said boxes in quote or design.  All boxes utilized MUST meet the FDOT applicable Indexes and be 
on the FDOT approved equipment list.  The following sizes are to be used wherever possible: 
 16x22x18 (straight wall) 
 16x22x30” (flared wall) 
 17x30x18” 
 24x36x30” (flared wall) 
 30x60x36”  
 



 
 
     

66 V-6 
October 1, 2009 (Revised January, 2010) 

   

CITY OF PALM COAST TECHNICAL MANUAL 
ENGINEERING DESIGN STANDARDS  

Please get all boxes approved during the design phase and prior to purchasing/installation of said 
boxes.  All box lids shall have a Logo embedded on them.  This logo is to be provided by the City of 
Palm Coast. 

 
 
 
 
 
Bend Radius: 
The main risk of damage to the fiber optic cable is by overlooking the minimum bending radius. It is 
important to know that the damage occurs more easily when the cable is bent under tension, so when 
the installation is in process be sure to allow for at least the minimum bending radius. The number of 90 
degree turns on a pull shall not exceed four (4). 
 
Reel Placement: 
Have the reel set adjacent to the manhole and use a fiber optic manhole pulling block assembly from 
Sherman & Reilly (or similar). 
 
Cable Slack: 
Please coil 150 feet of cable at the Transition, Termination points, and every 1500 feet. 
 
Splices: 
All splice locations will be designated by the City of Palm Coast communications department. 
 
Strength: 
The fibers in the cable will shatter under considerable impact, pressure or if pulling tensions exceed 
600 LB, although from the outside of the cable this will not be apparent. With fiber optic cable the jacket 
of the cable and the Kevlar layer directly beneath give the cable its strength so please be sure to note 
and repair all nicks and cuts. 
 
Installation: 
When installing use a swivel eye for pulling the fiber optic cable and conduit system. 
 
Precautions: 
Please review the manufacturer's installation instructions prior to commencing with the installation. If 
any questions arise during installation please refer to the manufacturer's installation instructions, or 
notify the project engineer. 
 
Testing: 
Perform OTDR test on each fiber in the installed cable, to verify the parameters of each fiber meet the 
system design criteria.  Power meter tests should also be performed.  Both of these tests should be 
performed as stated in the referenced RFP and as stated elsewhere in this document. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
Depth (Minimum / Maximum): 
The conduit used as the primary carrier of the fiber optic cable should be buried no greater than 42” 
and no less than 36” beneath grade except where code requires otherwise or directed in writing by the 
Project Engineer on behalf of the City of Palm Coast. 

Section 100.07 Guidelines for Installing/Pulling Underground Fiber Optic Cable 

Section 100.08 Guidelines for Installing Conduit 











 
 
     

 

   

CITY OF PALM COAST TECHNICAL MANUAL 
ENGINEERING DESIGN STANDARDS  

V-91 
October 1, 2009 (Revised January, 2010) 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
   THIS SPACE INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Section 1100.06 Saltwater Canals 

Drawing # 1100.A – Saltwater Canal Typical Seawall           



 
 
     

 

   

CITY OF PALM COAST TECHNICAL MANUAL 
ENGINEERING DESIGN STANDARDS  

V-92 
October 1, 2009 (Revised January, 2010) 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Drawing # 1100.B – Saltwater Canal Typical Bulkhead          

Drawing # 1100.C – Saltwater Canal Typical Revetment (Rip Rap)    



 
 
     

 

   

CITY OF PALM COAST TECHNICAL MANUAL 
ENGINEERING DESIGN STANDARDS  

V-93 
October 1, 2009 (Revised January, 2010) 

 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 

PALM COAST DATUM 
TIDAL DATUM NGVD 29 NAVD 88 
ELEVATION OF SEAWALL/BULKHEAD CAP 3.5 FEET 2.5 FEET 
APROXIMATE ELEVATION OF MEAN HIGH WATER   (MHW) 1.0 FEET 0.0 FEET 
APROXIMATE ELEVATION OF MEAN SEA LEVEL      (MSL) 0.0 FEET -1.0 FEET 
APROXIMATE ELEVATION OF MEAN LOW WATER   (MLW) -1.0 FEET -2.0 FEET 
ELEVATION OF CANAL BOTTOM AT SEAWALL BASE -0.5 FEET -1.5 FEET 
ELEVATION OF SILTATION LIMIT AT CENTERLINE OF CANAL - 6.0 FEET - 7.0 FEET 
ELEVATION OF PERMITTED DREDGING LIMIT AT 
CENTERLINE OF CANAL - 8.0 FEET -9.0 FEET 

To convert National Geodetic Vertical Datum 1929 (NGVD 29) to North American Vertical Datum 
1988 (NAVD 88) The National Geodetic Survey (NGS) Vertical Conversion (VERTCON) 
correction for Palm Coast, which is site specific, ranges between -1.03 to -1.04 feet.  This 
correction factor is typically rounded down to -1.0 feet. 

 
 
 
 

Drawing # 1100.D – Saltwater Canal Typical Undisturbed Bank         

Section 1100.07 Tidal Datum for Palm Coast 



 
 
     

 

   

CITY OF PALM COAST TECHNICAL MANUAL 
ENGINEERING DESIGN STANDARDS  

V-94 
October 1, 2009 (Revised January, 2010) 

 
 
 
 
A. Dredging activities shall be conducted by a qualified contractor familiar with applicable best 

management practices concerning dredging operations.  Dredging operations are only allowed 
for maintenance purposes and must be conducted in accordance with U.S. Army Corps of 
Engineer (USACOE) Permit Number 198600824 (IP-DS). 

 
B. As most seawall panels are only 8' deep, property owners are cautioned that dredging to a 

depth greater than 4' (MEASURED FROM THE TOP OF THE SEAWALL OR BULKHEAD CAP) 
along the seawall/bulkhead is not only contrary to the current USACOE permit, but may 
compromise and weaken the structure, causing catastrophic failure of the seawall/bulkhead. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
A. Seawalls are generally located at the 0.5' elevation line below the mean sea level or lower (feet 

wet), which generally coincides with the property line on older properties in Palm Coast. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Section 1100.08 Dredging 

Section 1100.09 Seawalls / Bulkheads and Revetments 

Drawing # 1100.E – Saltwater Canal Typical 
                                  Seawall Profile         

Drawing # 1100.F – Saltwater Canal Typical 
                                 Bulkhead Profile



 
 
     

 

   

CITY OF PALM COAST TECHNICAL MANUAL 
ENGINEERING DESIGN STANDARDS  

V-95 
October 1, 2009 (Revised January, 2010) 

B. Bulkheads are generally located above the mean high water line or higher (feet dry). 
 
C. Seawalls and bulkheads are both vertical bulkheads. They are constructed the same way and 

are only allowed on saltwater canals. 
 
D. Vertical bulkheads shall have a reinforced concrete cap.  
 
E. The elevation of the top of cap shall be set at an elevation of 2.5' (North American Vertical 

Datum (NAVD) 1988) or match abutting existing caps.   
 
F. All vertical bulkheads shall be constructed of reinforced concrete, vinyl or aluminum and shall be 

gray in color. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

NOTES: 
1. Provide minimum 10' end return(s) unless abutting bulkhead exists. 
2. Butt proposed bulkhead to existing bulkhead with ½ inch expansion joint material. 
3. Extend seawall/bulkhead cap to intersect existing groundline of adjacent lot. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Drawing # 1100.G – Saltwater Canal Typical Seawall / Bulkhead End Return Detail    



 
 
     

 

   

CITY OF PALM COAST TECHNICAL MANUAL 
ENGINEERING DESIGN STANDARDS  

V-96 
October 1, 2009 (Revised January, 2010) 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
G. Revetments are generally constructed of rock to prevent erosion and armor the shoreline.  They 

are generally located well above the mean higher high water line. 
 

Drawing # 1100.H – Typical Saltwater Canal Revetment (Rip Rap) Profile     

Drawing # 1100.I – Typical Intracoastal Waterway Revetment (Rip Rap) Profile  



 
 
     

 

   

CITY OF PALM COAST TECHNICAL MANUAL 
ENGINEERING DESIGN STANDARDS  

V-97 
October 1, 2009 (Revised January, 2010) 

 
 
 
 
A. Provide a topographic survey of the lot.  On the survey all index trees 6" in diameter or greater, 

shall be located, noting diameter and type of tree. 
 
B. Provide a typical seawall grading plan. 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
A. For properties on which a building permit for a permitted structure has been issued on which 

construction will commence within 90 days of seawall/bulkhead or revetment completion, the 
following conditions will apply: 
1. Backfill shall be to the top of the seawall/bulkhead or revetment, establishing a swale not 

less than 5" from the structure and of adequate depth (not less than 6") and width to collect 
eroded material. 

2. Upon completion of the final grade on the site, the work shall be sodded.  In instances 
where sodding is delayed, erosion control devices shall be maintained until the site is 
sodded. 

3. For properties on which a building permit for a permitted structure has been issued on which 
construction will not commence within 90 days or for properties on which no building permit 
has been issued for a structure, but where a building permit has been issued for a 
seawall/bulkhead or revetment, the following conditions will apply: 
a. Lot clearing limitations: 

(1) Only the minimum area necessary for access and construction of the seawall 
/bulkhead or revetment and backfill shall be cleared. 

Section 1100.10 Seawalls / Bulkhead / Revetment Construction Permit 
Requirements 

Drawing # 1100.J – Saltwater Canal Typical Seawall Grading Plan 

Section 1100.11 Seawall / Bulkhead / Revetment Construction Permit 
Conditions



 
 
     

 

   

CITY OF PALM COAST TECHNICAL MANUAL 
ENGINEERING DESIGN STANDARDS  

V-98 
October 1, 2009 (Revised January, 2010) 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

(2) A minimum 15' wide buffer shall be preserved along each side lot line starting at a 
point 10' upland from the existing water line or 10' upland from the most landward 
point at which backfill is required, whichever is less. 

(3) Access to the property shall be limited to an area no wider than 15' and shall be 
located in the interior of the lot, a minimum of 15' from adjacent properties. 

(4) A 30' wide buffer shall be preserved along all property lines abutting a street right-
of-way except for the area cleared for the access point. 

(5) Tree protecting barricades shall be erected around the perimeter of the buffer 
areas that are to remain. 

Drawing # 1100.K – Topographic Survey with Sample Barrier Plan     



 
 
     

 

   

CITY OF PALM COAST TECHNICAL MANUAL 
ENGINEERING DESIGN STANDARDS  

V-99 
October 1, 2009 (Revised January, 2010) 

 
 
 
 
 
A. Setbacks from projection of side property line to structure installation shall be a minimum of 10'.  

For docks with slips, an additional foot of setback will be required for every foot of slipway over 
20 feet.  Other setbacks shall be considered based upon lot size, location, easements, existing 
structures and navigation. 

 
B. Docks, lifts and boat houses will be viewed for placement within the navigable waters of the City 

(waterbodies) on an individual basis with visual impact, navigational use and aesthetic quality of 
prime concern. 

 
C. All docks, inclusive of all components shall not exceed 65% of the distance along the shoreline 

which is common to the private residential property line and saltwater canal. 
 

D. Docks less than 6 feet from an adjacent seawall shall be level with the top of that seawall and 
shall not present a tripping hazard.  Docks greater than 6 feet from the adjacent seawall may be 
elevated above the seawall cap by a maximum of 1.5 inches for every foot of distance from the 
seawall.  In no case shall the slope of the walkway exceed a 10% slope. 

 
E. No docks or piers shall extend more than 12' into the navigable area of a saltwater canals of the 

City unless the canal is 100' or more in width, in which case they may extend as much as 16’.  
In both instances the protruding distance is measured at right angles to the property lines. 

 
F. Other than cantilevered safety walks, all dock walkways shall not be less than 3' or greater than 

6'. 
 

G. In all instances the intended orientation of the moored vessel shall be as parallel to the property 
line / seawall as possible.  Moorings perpendicular to the property line / seawall are not 
permitted. 

 
H. Fish cleaning stations / sink facilities on docks are not permitted. 

 
I. Accessory structures and concrete decks are not allowed along the seawall or in the easements 

and setbacks of the property. 
 

J. Single pilings or “dolphins” that may present a navigational hazard are not allowed in the 
waterways, but pilings may be installed along a seawall or bulkhead.  Twelve inches (12") wide 
decking between seawall pilings is allowed, if it is installed flush with the seawall cap. 

 
 
 
 
 

THIS SPACE INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK 
 
 
 
 
 

Section 1100.12 Docks on Saltwater Canals 



 
 
     

 

   

CITY OF PALM COAST TECHNICAL MANUAL 
ENGINEERING DESIGN STANDARDS  

V-100 
October 1, 2009 (Revised January, 2010) 

 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
K. The standard piling height is not more than 4 feet above the seawall cap.  Pilings higher than 

that may be approved depending upon the circumstances. 
 
L. Roofed over docks and lifts shall be restricted to maximum height criteria of 13’ above seawall 

cap, which is inclusive of a 4 ½:12 roof pitch as standard. 
 
M. All roofs must be “hip” style and are to match the same material and color as the existing home 

on the site. 
 
N. Maximum roof lengths over a dock slip, dock lift or water shall be as follows  

1. Roof lengths shall not exceed 46 feet on lots 85 feet or greater of water frontage. 
2. Roof lengths shall not exceed 42 feet on lots 80 to 84.9 feet of water frontage. 
3. Roof lengths shall not exceed 38 feet on lots 75 to 79.9 feet of water frontage. 
4. Roof lengths shall not exceed 34 feet on lots 70 to 74.9 feet of water frontage. 
5. Roof lengths shall not exceed 30 feet on lots 65 to 69.9 feet of water frontage. 
6. Roof lengths shall not exceed 26 feet on lots 60 to 64.9 feet of water frontage. 
7. Roof length size for lots with less than 60 feet of water frontage shall be determined on an 

individual case-by-case basis. 
 
 
 

Drawing # 1100.L – Saltwater Canal Typical Corner Dock Allocation   



 
 
     

 

   

CITY OF PALM COAST TECHNICAL MANUAL 
ENGINEERING DESIGN STANDARDS  

V-101 
October 1, 2009 (Revised January, 2010) 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

   
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

WATER FRONTAGE MAXIMUM ROOF LENGTH 
 

60 feet 
 

26 feet 
 

65 feet 
 

30 feet 
 

70 feet 
 

34 feet 
 

75 feet 
 

38 feet 
 

80 feet 
 

42 feet 
 

85 feet (and over) 
 

46 feet 
Roof lengths for lots with less than 60 feet of water frontage will be 

determined on a case-by-case basis. 
 
 
 
 

Drawing # 1100.M – Saltwater Canal Seawall 
Dock 

Drawing # 1100.N – Saltwater Canal 
Bulkhead Dock         

Table # 1100.A – Saltwater Canal Maximum Roof Lengths 



 
 
     

 

   

CITY OF PALM COAST TECHNICAL MANUAL 
ENGINEERING DESIGN STANDARDS  

V-102 
October 1, 2009 (Revised January, 2010) 

 
 
 
 
A. Floating docks shall not exceed a length of 20’. 
 
B. Only one floating dock is allowed per property. 

 
C. Floating docks may be used in conjunction with permanent docking structures but must still 

meet the criteria herein. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
A. All boat lifts, inclusive of all components, whether vertical or horizontal shall be mounted or 

installed within the 12’ or 16’ dimension allowed for structures in the waterway. 
 
B.       Waterfront lots with property line dimensions with less than 60’ of water frontage or lots with 

unusual conditions will be considered by the City on an individual basis.  Easements, culvert 
pipes, navigability, are considered as unusual conditions. 

 
 
 
 
 
A. Cantilever safety walk dimensions shall only be constructed to access the length necessary for 

the watercraft and not for any dock area contiguous to the lift. 
 
B.       Cantilever safety walk extensions shall be confined to a maximum of 12” beyond a 12’ dock and 

approved location of pilings.  In no case shall the cantilever extend 16’ beyond the rear property 
line. 

 
C.       All plans submitted for a cantilever safety walk shall be inclusive of all finished dimensions. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
A. Docks on the Intracoastal Waterway require a permit from the U.S. Army Corps of Engineers 

and may require additional permits from other federal and state agencies (i.e., Florida 
Department of Environmental Protection, St. Johns River Water Management District, etc.). 

 
B. Whenever there is a discrepancy of permitting requirements from any agency, the more 

stringent requirement shall apply.  
 
 
 
 

Section 1100.12.1 Floating Docks on Saltwater Canals 

Section 1100.12.2 Dock Lifts on Saltwater Canals 

Section 1100.12.3 Cantilevered Safety Walks on Saltwater Canals 

Section 1100.13 Docks on the Intracoastal Waterway 



 
 
     

 

   

CITY OF PALM COAST TECHNICAL MANUAL 
ENGINEERING DESIGN STANDARDS  

V-103 
October 1, 2009 (Revised January, 2010) 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

Section 1100.14 Freshwater Canals 

Drawing # 1100.P – Docks on Freshwater Canals



 
 
     

 

   

CITY OF PALM COAST TECHNICAL MANUAL 
ENGINEERING DESIGN STANDARDS  

V-104 
October 1, 2009 (Revised January, 2010) 

 
 
A. Structures to be constructed for purposes of access to waterways shall be designed to have a 

minimum cross-sectional area on the sides, in order to minimize the blocking of flow during high 
water conditions. 

 
B. No structure shall exceed a dimension of 10’ deep by 12’ wide.  Walkways to the structure shall 

not exceed 4’ in length and width.  If construction placement and dimensions cause vegetation 
beneath the structure to die and erosion subsequently occurs, steps shall be taken by the owner 
of the structure to prevent erosion. 

 
C. The drainage right-of-way shall not be filled in such a way as to reduce the cross-sectional area 

used for the flow of stormwater. 
 

D. Any ground cover disturbed in the right-of-way shall be replaced and properly maintained to 
prevent erosion. 

 
E. All structures and associated facilities shall be properly constructed and secured to prevent 

hazards from floating into the waterway.  To eliminate potential waterbody contamination 
resulting from paints, varnishes and other chemicals, all structures, excluding the roof, shall be 
constructed with natural wood materials unless it can be demonstrated that proposed chemicals 
or paints will not degrade the waterbody. 

 
F. Docks, decks, and other structures built over the waterbody shall have a minimum clearance of 

1’ above the normal water level. 
 

G. Dock railings are not required.  If they are installed, they shall be installed in such a way as to 
not impede or hinder the flow of stormwater during unusual storm events. i.e. Horizontal dock 
rails installed 2 high are acceptable.  A series of vertical pickets is not acceptable. 

 
H. Structures shall not project into a waterbody more than 8’ from the shoreline at the normal water 

level. 
 

I. No permanent source of electrical power, water, telephone, gas or other items requiring piping 
or cable shall be extended into the drainage right-of-way. 

 
J. Floating docks are not permitted. 

 
K. Structures shall not have enclosed sides.  Including but not limited to any solid material, 

screening, or clear plastic. 
 

L. The height from the deck to the lowest portion of the roof structure shall be a minimum of 7’ 
 

M. The highest peak of the roof shall not exceed 13’.  Roofed over docks shall be restricted to 
maximum height criteria of 13’ above the deck, which is inclusive of a 4 ½:12 roof pitch as 
standard. 

 
N. Roofs shall not be greater than 12’ by 14’ and the roof overhang shall not exceed 1’. 

 
O. All roofs must be “hip’ style and are to match the same material and color as the existing home 

on the adjacent site.  
 



 
 
     

 

   

CITY OF PALM COAST TECHNICAL MANUAL 
ENGINEERING DESIGN STANDARDS  

V-105 
October 1, 2009 (Revised January, 2010) 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
A. Silt fences shall be installed at the mean high water line.  If a turbidity barrier is installed, a silt 

fence is not required.  If a silt fence cannot be installed initially because of heavy shoreline 
vegetation, it shall be installed once the lot has been cleared within 24 hours. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
B. Floating turbidity barriers are required for work at or below the mean high water line such as 

dredging or vertical bulkhead installation.  Piling installation is exempt from this requirement.  
The permittee shall be responsible for the maintaining the barrier for the duration of the project 
to ensure continuous protection of the waterbody.  Repairs to the barrier will be performed in 
accordance with the manufacturer’s specifications. 

 
C. Once operations below the mean high water line are completed, the collected sediment will be 

removed and the original depth or plan elevation shall be restored.  Any spoils from the 
operation must be removed to an upland area and stabilized.  Suspended sediment will be 
allowed to settle before removing the barrier.  Floating turbidity barriers shall be removed in 
such a manner as to minimize turbidity.  

 

SECTION 1200  EROSION CONTROL 

Section 1200.01 Silt Fences / Floating Turbidity Barriers 

Drawing # 1200.A – Silt Fence Example



 
 
     

 

   

CITY OF PALM COAST TECHNICAL MANUAL 
ENGINEERING DESIGN STANDARDS  

V-106 
October 1, 2009 (Revised January, 2010) 

 
D. All construction and vegetative debris on the site shall be removed. 

 
E. All cleared areas shall be planted with lawn grass as provided for in Chapter 11 of the LDC.  It 

shall be the responsibility of the lot owner to insure sodded areas are watered until established. 
 

F. Prior to the start of construction, a floating turbidity barrier shall be installed to prevent siltation 
into the canal until the slopes are stabilized.  The ends of returns and the backside of 
seawall/bulkhead or revetment shall be sodded or stabilized with other appropriate vegetation a 
minimum of 5’ from the edge of the structure or stabilized with erosion control devices, to 
prevent siltation on adjacent properties or into the canal. 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
G. Floating turbidity barriers provide sedimentation protection for a water body from up-slope land 

disturbance where conventional erosion and sediment controls cannot be used, or from 
dredging or filling within the water body. 

 
H. Type I barriers are used in protected areas where there is no current and the area is sheltered 

from wind and waves. 
 

I. Type II barriers are used in protected areas where there may be small to moderate current 
and/or wind and wave action can affect the curtain. 

 
 
 
 
 
 

Drawing # 1200.B – Floating Turbidity Barrier Example  

http://www.ci.palm-coast.fl.us/CityDocs/Departments/CommunityDevelopment/LDC/Chapter%2011%20-%20Tree%20Protection,%20Landscaping,%20Buffers%20and%20Irrigation.pdf
http://www.ci.palm-coast.fl.us/Government/Departments/Community_Development/LDC.aspx


 
 
     

 

   

CITY OF PALM COAST TECHNICAL MANUAL 
ENGINEERING DESIGN STANDARDS  

V-107 
October 1, 2009 (Revised January, 2010) 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
City of Palm Coast Capital Improvement Projects shall be marked with a sign identifying the Project 
Name, Project Amount, Project Contractor, and Funding Sources as shown in the Sample Construction 
Sign shown in Drawing 1300.A below.  
 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 
 
 
A. The City has created a standard monument sign, directory and directional signs to be used at 

City Facilities 
 
B. The standard designs for these signs are master filed in the building department for use with 

future projects therefore signed and sealed drawings will not be required for each sign to be 
constructed. 

 
 
 

 

SECTION 1300  CAPITAL PROJECTS - CITY OF PALM COAST 

Section 1300.01 Construction Information Signs 

Drawing # 1300.A – Sample Construction Sign 

Section 1300.02 Monument Sign for City Facilities 

Drawing # 1300.B – Sample Monument Sign 


